
1
Supplier QTY UOM Price

2
Supplier QTY UOM Price

3
Supplier QTY UOM Price

4
Supplier QTY UOM Price

5
Supplier QTY UOM Price
DeMoulin Brothers & Company 1 EA $9.00 Recommended

6
Supplier QTY UOM Price

7
Supplier QTY UOM Price

8
Supplier QTY UOM Price

9
Supplier QTY UOM Price
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Marching Band Shako Wrap

Marching Band Shako Case

Marching Band Plume

Marching Band Coat

Marching Band Bibber/Pant

Marching Band Shako

Marching Band Gauntlet

Marching Band Dry-fit Undershirt

Marching Band Shoes
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10
Supplier QTY UOM Price
Theatre House (Fourth Wall LLC) 1 EA $6.95 Recommeended

11
Supplier QTY UOM Price

12
Supplier QTY UOM Price

13
Supplier QTY UOM Price

14
Supplier QTY UOM Price

15
Supplier QTY UOM Price

16
Supplier QTY UOM Price

17
Supplier QTY UOM Price

18
Supplier QTY UOM Price

Marching Band Gloves

Shoulder Cords

Digital Print Marching Shirt/Coat

Digital Print Marching Pants/Bibber

Marching Band Raincoat

Marching Band Uniform Garment Bag

Marching Band Uniform Plume Case

Tuxedo Coat

Tuxedo Dress Pant
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19
Supplier QTY UOM Price

20
Supplier QTY UOM Price

21
Supplier QTY UOM Price
Theatre House (Fourth Wall LLC) 1 EA $4.95 1st Vendor of Choice
[ALT1] Theatre House (Fourth Wall LLC) 1 EA $6.95 2nd Vendor of Choice

22
Supplier QTY UOM Price

23
Supplier QTY UOM Price

24
Supplier QTY UOM Price
RGV Mariachi Warehouse 1 EA $300.00 1st Vendor of Choice
Mariachi Clothing Company (fredd j sanchez) 1 EA $420.00 2nd Vendor of Choice
[ALT2] Mariachi Clothing Company (fredd j sanchez) 1 EA $435.00 3rd Vendor of Choice

25
Supplier QTY UOM Price
RGV Mariachi Warehouse 1 EA $310.00 1st Vendor of Choice
Mariachi Clothing Company (fredd j sanchez) 1 EA $450.00 2nd Vendor of Choice
[ALT1] Mariachi Clothing Company (fredd j sanchez) 1 EA $475.00 3rd Vendor of Choice

Long Concert Dress

Men's 2-Piece Traje de Gala

Men's 3-Piece Traje de Gala

Tuxedo Dress Shirt

Tuxedo Vest

Bow Tie

Cummerbund
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26
Supplier QTY UOM Price
Mariachi Clothing Company (fredd j sanchez) 1 EA $35.00 1st Vendor of Choice
[ALT1] Mariachi Clothing Company (fredd j sanchez) 1 EA $40.00 2nd Vendor of Choice
[ALT2] Mariachi Clothing Company (fredd j sanchez) 1 EA $45.00 3rd Vendor of Choice

27
Supplier QTY UOM Price
Mariachi Clothing Company (fredd j sanchez) 1 EA $18.00 1st Vendor of Choice
RGV Mariachi Warehouse 1 EA $25.00 2nd Vendor of Choice
Delgado Guitars, LLC 1 EA $45.00 3rd Vendor of Choice

28
Supplier QTY UOM Price
RGV Mariachi Warehouse 1 EA $205.00 1st Vendor of Choice
Delgado Guitars, LLC 1 EA $300.00 3rd Vendor of Choice
[ALT1] Mariachi Clothing Company (fredd j sanchez) 1 EA $350.00 2nd Vendor of Choice

29
Supplier QTY UOM Price
Mariachi Clothing Company (fredd j sanchez) 1 EA $55.00 2nd Vendor of Choice
RGV Mariachi Warehouse 1 EA $55.00 1st Vendor of Choice
Delgado Guitars, LLC 1 EA $85.00 3rd Vendor of Choice

30
Supplier QTY UOM Price
Mariachi Clothing Company (fredd j sanchez) 1 EA $20.00 1st Vendor of Choice
[ALT1] Mariachi Clothing Company (fredd j sanchez) 1 EA $25.00 3rd Vendor of Choice
RGV Mariachi Warehouse 1 EA $30.00 2nd Vendor of Choice

Men's Camisa de Caporal

Mariachi Tie

Mariachi Sombrero

Mariachi Belt

Mariachi Hair Bow
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31
Supplier QTY UOM Price
RGV Mariachi Warehouse 1 EA $300.00 1st Vendor of Choice
Mariachi Clothing Company (fredd j sanchez) 1 EA $465.00 2nd Vendor of Choice
Delgado Guitars, LLC 1 EA $695.00 3rd Vendor of Choice

32
Supplier QTY UOM Price
RGV Mariachi Warehouse 1 EA $310.00 1st Vendor of Choice
Mariachi Clothing Company (fredd j sanchez) 1 EA $495.00 2nd Vendor of Choice
Delgado Guitars, LLC 1 EA $795.00 3rd Vendor of Choice

33
Supplier QTY UOM Price
RGV Mariachi Warehouse 1 EA $50.00 1st Vendor of Choice
Mariachi Clothing Company (fredd j sanchez) 1 EA $55.00 2nd Vendor of Choice
Delgado Guitars, LLC 1 EA $85.00 3rd Vendor of Choice

34
Supplier QTY UOM Price
Mariachi Clothing Company (fredd j sanchez) 1 EA $15.00 1st Vendor of Choice
RGV Mariachi Warehouse 1 EA $25.00 2nd Vendor of Choice
[ALT1] Mariachi Clothing Company (fredd j sanchez) 1 EA $25.00 3rd Vendor of Choice

35
Supplier QTY UOM Price
RGV Mariachi Warehouse 1 EA $25.00 1st Vendor of Choice
Mariachi Clothing Company (fredd j sanchez) 1 EA $80.00 2nd Vendor of Choice
[ALT1] Mariachi Clothing Company (fredd j sanchez) 1 EA $100.00 3rd Vendor of Choice

Women's 2-Piece Traje de Gala

Mariachi Suit Cover/Garment Bag

Sombrero Hat Cover

Women's 3-Piecce Traje de Gala

Bontines for Marachi
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36
Supplier QTY UOM Price
Delgado Guitars, LLC 1 EA No Bid No Bid Received
Theatre House (Fourth Wall LLC) 1 EA No Bid No Bid Received
DeMoulin Brothers & Company 1 EA No Bid No Bid Received
Team Go Figure (Single Piece Apparel) 1 EA No Bid No Bid Received
Mariachi Clothing Company (fredd j sanchez) 1 EA No Bid No Bid Received
RGV Mariachi Warehouse 1 EA No Bid No Bid Received
Fred J. Miller, Inc. 1 EA No Bid No Bid Received

37
Supplier QTY UOM Price
Delgado Guitars, LLC 1 EA No Bid No Bid Received
Theatre House (Fourth Wall LLC) 1 EA No Bid No Bid Received
DeMoulin Brothers & Company 1 EA No Bid No Bid Received
Team Go Figure (Single Piece Apparel) 1 EA No Bid No Bid Received
Mariachi Clothing Company (fredd j sanchez) 1 EA No Bid No Bid Received
RGV Mariachi Warehouse 1 EA No Bid No Bid Received
Fred J. Miller, Inc. 1 EA No Bid No Bid Received

38
Supplier QTY UOM Price

39
Supplier QTY UOM Price

40
Supplier QTY UOM Price

Estudiantina Cape

Estudiantina Vest

Tie

Show Choir Dress

Show Choir Jacket
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41
Supplier QTY UOM Price

42
Supplier QTY UOM Price

43
Supplier QTY UOM Price

44
Supplier QTY UOM Price

45
Supplier QTY UOM Price

46
Supplier QTY UOM Price

47
Supplier QTY UOM Price

48
Supplier QTY UOM Price

49
Supplier QTY UOM Price
Theatre House (Fourth Wall LLC) 1 EA $9.95 Recommended

Dress Pants

Show Choir Dress Shirt

Show Choir Skirt

Show Choir Tunic

Show Choir Tie

Show Choir Accessories

Show Choir Shoes

T-Shirt

Tights
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50
Supplier QTY UOM Price
RGV Mariachi Warehouse 1 EA $25.00 Recommended

51
Supplier QTY UOM Price

52
Supplier QTY UOM % Discount
DeMoulin Brothers & Company 1 EA 5.0% Recommended
Team Go Figure (Single Piece Apparel) 1 EA 0.0% Recommended
RGV Mariachi Warehouse 1 EA 0.0% Recommended
Fred J. Miller, Inc. 1 EA 0.0% Recommended

53
Supplier QTY UOM % Discount
DeMoulin Brothers & Company 1 EA 5.0% Recommended
Team Go Figure (Single Piece Apparel) 1 EA 0.0% Recommended
RGV Mariachi Warehouse 1 EA 0.0% Recommended
Fred J. Miller, Inc. 1 EA 0.0% Recommended

54
Supplier QTY UOM % Discount
Theatre House (Fourth Wall LLC) 1 EA 5.0% Recommended
RGV Mariachi Warehouse 1 EA 0.0% Recommended
Delgado Guitars, LLC 1 EA 0.0% Recommended

Dance Briefs

Percentage Discount on Marching Band Uniforms, Supplies and Equipment from your latest catalog and price list.

Percentage Discount on Concert Tuxedos, Concert Dresses, Supplies and equipment from your latest catalog and price list.

Percentage Discount on Mariachi Uniforms, supplies and equipment from your latest catalog and price list.

Garment Bags
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55
Supplier QTY UOM % Discount
RGV Mariachi Warehouse 1 EA 0.0% Recommended

56
Supplier QTY UOM % Discount
DeMoulin Brothers & Company 1 EA 5.0% Recommended
Team Go Figure (Single Piece Apparel) 1 EA 0.0% Recommended
RGV Mariachi Warehouse 1 EA 0.0% Recommended
Fred J. Miller, Inc. 1 EA 0.0% Recommended

57
Supplier QTY UOM % Discount
Theatre House (Fourth Wall LLC) 1 EA 5.0% Recommended
DeMoulin Brothers & Company 1 EA 0.0% Recommended
Team Go Figure (Single Piece Apparel) 1 EA 0.0% Recommended
RGV Mariachi Warehouse 1 EA 0.0% Recommended
Fred J. Miller, Inc. 1 EA 0.0% Recommended

Percentage Discount on Choral uniforms, supplies and equipment from your latest catalog and price list.

Percentage Discount on your latest list / catalog or website on related items: Dancewear, Uniforms, Costumes, Footwear, etc.

Percentage Discount on Estudiantina uniforms, supplies and equipment from your latest catalog and price list.
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