



Board Meeting of August 2, 2022
Bid # 23-062 Motor Oil and Automotive Fluids District-Wide

1	Antifreeze, 50/50, Ethylene Glycol (greenish color)				
Supplier					
Arguindogui Oil Co. II, Ltd	QTY	UOM	Price		Recommended
	1	55 gal drum	\$354.50		
2	Antifreeze, 50/50 Ethylene Glycol (reddish color)				
Supplier					
Arguindogui Oil Co. II, Ltd	QTY	UOM	Price		Recommended
	1	55 gal drum	\$374.00		
3	Motor Oil, SAE 5W-20, Synthetic Blend				
Supplier					
Arguindogui Oil Co. II, Ltd	QTY	UOM	Price		Recommended
	1	gallon	\$12.82		
4	Motor Oil, SAE 5W-20, Synthetic Blend				
Supplier					
RGV Pump & Equipment, LLC	QTY	UOM	Price		Recommended
	1	55 gal drum	\$456.15		
5	Motor Oil, SAE 15W-40, API- CJ4				
Supplier					
OIL PATCH FUEL & SUPPLY, INC.	QTY	UOM	Price		Recommended
	1	5 gal ctnr	\$59.95		
6	(Bulk Tank) Motor Oil, SAE 15W-40, (TO INCLUDE 300 GALLON BULK STORAGE TANK AND DISPENSING UNIT; THIS UNIT WILL BE PROVIDED FREE OF CHARGE THRU THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT.) - SHELL, VALVOLINE, PENNZOIL, QUAKER STATE OR EQUAL. NO HOUSE BLENDS. - (1 Tank to the Transportation Dept 2601 Dana Ave)				
Supplier					
OIL PATCH FUEL & SUPPLY, INC.	QTY	UOM	Price		Recommended
	1	Tank 300 Gallons	\$3,408.00		
7	Motor Oil, Synthetic, SAE 15W-40, API- CJ4				
Supplier					
Arguindogui Oil Co. II, Ltd	QTY	UOM	Price		Recommended
	1	gallon	\$16.38		
8	(Bulk Tank) ATF, Dextron III- Mercon & Mercon V - (TO INCLUDE 300 GALLON BULK STORAGE TANK AND DISPENSING UNIT; THIS UNIT WILL BE PROVIDED FREE OF CHARGE THRU THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT.) - (1 Tank to the Transportation Dept 2601 Dana Ave)				
Supplier					
[ALT1] RGV Pump & Equipment, LLC	QTY	UOM	Price		Recommended
	1	Tank 300 Gallons	\$2,568.00		
9	ATF, Mercon V				
Supplier					
Arguindogui Oil Co. II, Ltd	QTY	UOM	Price		Recommended
	1	gallon	\$13.58		
10	ATF, Synthetic, Dextron III- Mercon				
Supplier					
Arguindogui Oil Co. II, Ltd	QTY	UOM	Price		Recommended
	1	gallon	\$13.58		



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BROWNSVILLE
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting of August 2, 2022

Bid # 23-062 Motor Oil and Automotive Fluids District-Wide

11	ATF, Synthetic, Mercon V Supplier Arguindegui Oil Co. II, Ltd	QTY 1	UOM gallon	Price \$13.58	Recommended
12	Gear Oil, 80W-90, API GL-5 Supplier RGV Pump & Equipment, LLC	QTY 1	UOM 5 gal ctnr	Price \$95.62	Recommended
13	Gear Oil, 85W-140, API GL-5 Supplier RGV Pump & Equipment, LLC	QTY 1	UOM 5 gal ctnr	Price \$95.62	Recommended
14	Gear Oil, Synthetic 75W-90, API GL-5 Supplier RGV Pump & Equipment, LLC	QTY 1	UOM 5 gal ctnr	Price \$117.19	Recommended
15	DONAX TX OR EQUAL HD AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID Supplier [ALT1] RGV Pump & Equipment, LLC	QTY 1	UOM 55 GAL DRUM	Price \$512.80	Recommended
16	POWER STEERING FLUID (FORD, GM, CHRYSLER) OEM Supplier	QTY 1	UOM Gallon	Price No Bid	
17	WINDEX OR EQUAL Supplier OIL PATCH FUEL & SUPPLY, INC.	QTY 1	UOM 55 GAL Drum	Price \$34.99	Recommended
18	SOOT CLEANER - COBRA CLEAN DEGREASER 103X/COCL55G OR EQUAL *EQUAL PRODUCT MUST BE APPROVED BY TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT PRIOR TO AWARD. Supplier OIL PATCH FUEL & SUPPLY, INC.	QTY 1	UOM 55 GAL DRUM	Price \$895.00	Recommended
19	A/C COIL CLEANER Supplier	QTY 1	UOM 55 GAL Drum	Price No Bid	
20	(Bulk Tank) DEF (Diesel Additive) (To include 330 gallon bulk storage tank and dispensing unit; this unit will be provided free of charge thru the term of the contract.) Two (2) tanks at Transportation Dept - 2601 Dane Ave. Supplier RGV Pump & Equipment, LLC	QTY 1	UOM Tank 330 Gallons	Price \$954.00	Recommended



Board Meeting of August 2, 2022

Bid # 23-062 Motor Oil and Automotive Fluids District-Wide

21	15W-40 CJ4 HEAVY DUTY DIESEL ENGINE OIL SHELL ROTELLA T5 (TO INCLUDE 300 GALLON BULK STORAGE TANK AND DISPENSING UNIT; THIS UNIT WILL BE PROVIDED FREE OF CHARGE THRU THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT.) - NO HOUSE BLENDS - SYNTHETIC BLEND. 1 TANK AT TRANSPORTATION DEPT - 2601 DANE AVE.					
Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price		
OIL PATCH FUEL & SUPPLY, INC.		1	Tank 300 Gallons	\$3,969.00	Recommended	
22	PARTS WASHER WITH FLUID; WITH 1 YEAR MAINTENANCE AGREEMENT TO INCLUDE 4 TIME A YEAR - DISPOSE OF OLD CLEANER (SOLVENT) AND REPLACE WITH NEW CLEANER (SOLVENT).					
Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price		
		1	30 GAL	No Bid		
23	ALL Other Related Products Not Listed Above- % Discount from trade catalog					
Supplier		QTY	UOM	% Discount		
		1	DISCOUNT	No Bid		