



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT

BROWNSVILLE

INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 2, 2022

RFP # 22-025-E1 Consultant/Presenter Services & Training District-Wide (Extension 1 of 3)

1	Hourly rate per service/training	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Recommended
		Early Childhood Writing Consultants, LLC	1	EA	\$20.00	Recommended
		Barobo, Inc.	1	EA	\$25.00	Recommended
		[ALT1] Barobo, Inc.	1	EA	\$25.00	Recommended
		[ALT2] Barobo, Inc.	1	EA	\$25.00	Recommended
		Phoenix Rising Enterprises	1	EA	\$40.00	Recommended
		Dancing Thru Life	1	EA	\$65.00	Recommended
		FERNANDO CORNEJO	1	EA	\$70.00	Recommended
		James A. Telese, Ph.D	1	EA	\$100.00	Recommended
		South Texas Interpreters for the Deaf LLC	1	EA	\$110.00	Recommended
		Libra Bilingual Connections	1	EA	\$166.60	Recommended
		A Plus Educational Consulting (Judith Rodriguez)	1	EA	\$200.00	Recommended
		Foundations In Teaching (Rogelio Gomez)	1	EA	\$200.00	Recommended
		[ALT1] Educational Directions	1	EA	\$200.00	Recommended
		Educating Diverse Learners	1	EA	\$250.00	Recommended
		Eduphoral Incorporated	1	EA	\$250.00	Recommended
		The University of Texas Rio Grande Valley	1	EA	\$300.00	Recommended
		[ALT2] Educational Directions	1	EA	\$300.00	Recommended
		Valley Speech Language and Learning Center	1	EA	\$350.00	Recommended
		Rivera Educational Consulting (Rivera Educational Consulting LLC)	1	EA	\$350.00	Recommended
		365 Health & Wellness, Inc.	1	EA	\$350.00	Recommended
		Don't Click Consulting	1	EA	\$350.00	Recommended
		Liberty Source	1	EA	\$400.00	Recommended
		Peak Performance Professional Development	1	EA	\$400.00	Recommended
		Rise Above Educational Solutions	1	EA	\$400.00	Recommended
		Northwest Council for Computer Education	1	EA	\$500.00	Recommended
		s3strategies, LLC	1	EA	\$600.00	Recommended
		DMR Educational Consulting	1	EA	\$800.00	Recommended
		Scholastic Inc.	1	EA	\$999.00	Recommended
		Neuhaus Education Center (The W. Oscar Neuhaus Memorial Foundation)	1	EA	\$1,033.00	Recommended
		The Writing Academy, LLC	1	EA	No B d	



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT

BROWNSVILLE

INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 2, 2022

RFP # 22-025-E1 Consultant/Presenter Services & Training District-Wide (Extension 1 of 3)

1	Hourly rate per service/training				
	Franklin Covey Client Sales Inc.	1	EA	No Bid	
	Holistic Fluency, L.L.C. (Educational Consulting)	1	EA	No Bid	
	Ingenutiy Consultants LLC	1	EA	No Bid	
	UpRiver Education	1	EA	No Bid	
	Shadowing Success, LLC	1	EA	No Bid	
	Kagan Professional Development	1	EA	No Bid	
	Instruction Partners	1	EA	No Bid	
	The Princeton Review (TPR Education, LLC)	1	EA	No Bid	
	Pressing Onward (Jennifer Kleiber)	1	EA	No Bid	
	The IEP Coach LLC	1	EA	No Bid	
	Nance Educational Solutions, LLC (www.NanceEducationalSolutions.com)	1	EA	No Bid	
	Forde-Ferrier, LLC	1	EA	No Bid	
	Dr. Mikel (Mike Longoria)	1	EA	No Bid	
	Empowering Writers	1	EA	No Bid	
	VB Educator Consulting	1	EA	No Bid	



RFP # 22-025-E1 Consultant/Presenter Services & Training District-Wide (Extension 1 of 3)

22-025-E1 - Page 3



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT

BROWNSVILLE

INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 2, 2022

RFP # 22-025-E1 Consultant/Presenter Services & Training District-Wide (Extension 1 of 3)

2	1/2 day rate per services/training					
	Dr. Mikel (Mike Longoria)	1	EA	\$3,750.00	Recommended	
	UpRiver Education	1	EA	\$3,900.00	Recommended	
	The IEP Coach LLC	1	EA	No Bid		
	Nance Educational Solutions, LLC (www.NanceEducationalSolutions.com)	1	EA	No Bid		
	The Princeton Review (TPR Education, LLC)	1	EA	No Bid		
	Kagan Professional Development	1	EA	No Bid		
	Eduphorial Incorporated	1	EA	No Bid		
	Valley Speech Language and Learning Center	1	EA	No Bid		
	Empowering Writers	1	EA	No Bid		
	Franklin Covey Client Sales Inc.	1	EA	No Bid		
	Holistic Fluency, L.L.C. (Educational Consulting)	1	EA	No Bid		
	The Writing Academy, LLC	1	EA	No Bid		
	Instruction Partners	1	EA	No Bid		



RFP # 22-025-E1 Consultant/Presenter Services & Training District-Wide (Extension 1 of 3)

22-025-E1 - Page 5



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT

BROWNSVILLE

INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 2, 2022

RFP # 22-025-E1 Consultant/Presenter Services & Training District-Wide (Extension 1 of 3)

3	Full day rate per service/training				
	Dr. Mikel (Mike Longoria)	1	EA	\$3,750.00	Recommended
	s3strategies, LLC	1	EA	\$3,750.00	Recommended
	VB Educator Consulting	1	EA	\$3,800.00	Recommended
	Scholastic Inc.	1	EA	\$3,999.00	Recommended
	DMR Educational Consulting	1	EA	\$4,000.00	Recommended
	Northwest Council for Computer Education	1	EA	\$4,000.00	Recommended
	Empowering Writers	1	EA	\$4,000.00	Recommended
	Holistic Fluency, L.L.C. (Educational Consulting)	1	EA	\$4,100.00	Recommended
	The IEP Coach LLC	1	EA	\$4,200.00	Recommended
	Ingenuity Consultants LLC	1	EA	\$5,000.00	Recommended
	College 1st Program (Vision Ed Group)	1	EA	\$5,000.00	Recommended
	Shadowing Success, LLC	1	EA	\$5,000.00	Recommended
	Instruction Partners	1	EA	\$5,273.00	Recommended
	Neuhaus Education Center (The W. Oscar Neuhaus Memorial Foundation)	1	EA	\$6,200.00	Recommended
	UpRiver Education	1	EA	\$7,800.00	Recommended
	[ALT1] UpRiver Education	1	EA	\$19,250.00	Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT

BROWNSVILLE

INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 2, 2022

RFP # 22-025-E1 Consultant/Presenter Services & Training District-Wide (Extension 1 of 3)

4 Percentage discount on training supplies materials					
Supplier	QTY	UOM	% Discount		
Shadowing Success, LLC	1	EA	No Bid		
Dancing Thru Life	1	EA	No Bid		
The IEP Coach LLC	1	EA	No Bid		
Nance Educational Solutions, LLC (www.NanceEducationalSolutions.com)	1	EA	No Bid		
DMR Educational Consulting	1	EA	No Bid		
Kagan Professional Development	1	EA	No Bid		
Instruction Partners	1	EA	No Bid		
Early Childhood Writing Consultants, LLC	1	EA	75.0%		Recommended
UpRiver Education	1	EA	20.0%		Recommended
Foundations In Teaching (Rogelio Gomez)	1	EA	15.0%		Recommended
Northwest Council for Computer Education	1	EA	15.0%		Recommended
The Princeton Review (TPR Education, LLC)	1	EA	11.0%		Recommended
Ingenuity Consultants LLC	1	EA	10.0%		Recommended
Barobo, Inc.	1	EA	10.0%		Recommended
VB Educator Consulting	1	EA	10.0%		Recommended
Holistic Fluency, L.L.C. (Educational Consulting)	1	EA	10.0%		Recommended
Rivera Educational Consulting (Rivera Educational Consulting LLC)	1	EA	10.0%		Recommended
Forde-Ferrier, LLC	1	EA	10.0%		Recommended
Libra Bilingual Connections	1	EA	10.0%		Recommended
365 Health & Wellness, Inc.	1	EA	5.0%		Recommended
Dr. Mikel (Mike Longoria)	1	EA	5.0%		Recommended
The Writing Academy, LLC	1	EA	5.0%		Recommended
Don't Click Consulting	1	EA	5.0%		Recommended
FERNANDO CORNEJO	1	EA	2.0%		Recommended
Empowering Writers	1	EA	1.0%		Recommended
Eduphorial Incorporated	1	EA	0.0%		Recommended
Scholastic Inc.	1	EA	0.0%		Recommended
Liberty Source	1	EA	0.0%		Recommended
Valley Speech Language and Learning Center	1	EA	0.0%		Recommended
College 1st Program (Vision Ed Group)	1	EA	0.0%		Recommended
Neuhaus Education Center (The W. Oscar Neuhaus Memorial Foundation)	1	EA	0.0%		Recommended
Franklin Covey Client Sales Inc.	1	EA	0.0%		Recommended



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT

BROWNSVILLE

INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting August 2, 2022

RFP # 22-025-E1 Consultant/Presenter Services & Training District-Wide (Extension 1 of 3)

4	Percentage discount on training supplies materials				
	James A. Telese, Ph.D	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended
	s3strategies, LLC	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended
	South Texas Interpreters for the Deaf LLC	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended
	Pressing Onward (Jennifer Kleiber)	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended
	Rise Above Educational Solutions	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended
	Peak Performance Professional Development	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended
	A Plus Educational Consulting (Judith Rodriguez)	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended
	Educational Directions	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended
	Phoenix Rising Enterprises	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended
	The University of Texas Rio Grande Valley	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended
	Educating Diverse Learners	1	EA	0.0%	Recommended