



Brownsville Independent School District
Board Meeting of August 4, 2020
Bid #20-018 Recycling Services District-Wide (Reverse Bid)

1 Cardboard and Paper				
Supplier				
	Redfish Recycling (Marck Industries of Texas)	QTY	UOM	Price
		1	EA	\$375.00
				RECOMMENDED
1.1 Cardboard (FNS)				
Supplier				
	Redfish Recycling (Marck Industries of Texas)	QTY	UOM	Price
		1	EA	\$90.00
				RECOMMENDED
1.2 Newspaper (Records Management)				
Supplier				
	Redfish Recycling (Marck Industries of Texas)	QTY	UOM	Price
		1	EA	\$5.00
				RECOMMENDED
1.3 Magazines(Records Management)				
Supplier				
	Redfish Recycling (Marck Industries of Texas)	QTY	UOM	Price
		1	EA	\$5.00
				RECOMMENDED
1.4 Books(Records Management)				
Supplier				
	Redfish Recycling (Marck Industries of Texas)	QTY	UOM	Price
		1	EA	\$5.00
				RECOMMENDED
1.5 Office Paper [white paper] (Records Management)				
Supplier				
	Redfish Recycling (Marck Industries of Texas)	QTY	UOM	Price
		1	EA	\$160.00
				RECOMMENDED
1.6 Office Paper [mixed paper *colored, etc.] (Records Management)				
Supplier				
	Redfish Recycling (Marck Industries of Texas)	QTY	UOM	Price
		1	EA	\$110.00
				RECOMMENDED



Brownsville Independent School District
Board Meeting of August 4, 2020
Bid #20-018 Recycling Services District-Wide (Reverse Bid)

2 Metal							
Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price			
Redfish Recycling (Marck Industries of Texas)		1	EA	\$100.00		RECOMMENDED	
2.1 Tin (FNS)							
Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price			
Redfish Recycling (Marck Industries of Texas)		1	EA	\$20.00		RECOMMENDED	
2.2 Scrap Metal (Maintenance Transportation)							
Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price			
Redfish Recycling (Marck Industries of Texas)		1	EA	\$20.00		RECOMMENDED	
2.3 Steel (Maintenance Transportation)							
Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price			
Redfish Recycling (Marck Industries of Texas)		1	EA	\$20.00		RECOMMENDED	
2.4 Aluminum (Maintenance Transportation)							
Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price			
Redfish Recycling (Marck Industries of Texas)		1	EA	\$20.00		RECOMMENDED	
2.5 Copper (Maintenance Transportation)							
Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price			
Redfish Recycling (Marck Industries of Texas)		1	EA	\$20.00		RECOMMENDED	
3 Wood (District Wide)							
NO BIDS RECEIVED							
3.1 Standard Wood Pallets							
Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price			
Redfish Recycling (Marck Industries of Texas)		1	EA	No Bid			
3.2 Scrap Wood Pallets							
Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price			
Redfish Recycling (Marck Industries of Texas)		1	EA	No Bid			



Brownsville Independent School District
Board Meeting of August 4, 2020
Bid #20-018 Recycling Services District-Wide (Reverse Bid)

3.3	Scrap Wood				
Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price	
Redfish Recycling (Marck Industries of Texas)		1	EA	No Bid	
4	Used Tires (District Wide)				
Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price	
Redfish Recycling (Marck Industries of Texas)		1	EA	No Bid	
5	Plastics (District Wide)				
Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price	
Redfish Recycling (Marck Industries of Texas)		1	EA	\$5.00	RECOMMENDED
6	Any other recycled materials not listed on bid (District Wide). Please submit a price list/sheet or description of the items that your firm recycles.				
Supplier		QTY	UOM	Price	
Redfish Recycling (Marck Industries of Texas)		1	EA	\$1.00	RECOMMENDED